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For much of the twentieth century improvement in the situation of disadvantaged communities was a focus
for urban planning and policy. Yet over the past three decades the ideological triumph of neoliberalism has
caused the allocation of spatial, political, economic, and financial resources to favor economic growth at the
expense of wider social benefits. Susan Fainstein's concept of the "just city" encourages planners and
policymakers to embrace a different approach to urban development. Her objective is to combine progressive
city planners' earlier focus on equity and material well-being with considerations of diversity and
participation so as to foster a better quality of urban life within the context of a global capitalist political
economy. Fainstein applies theoretical concepts about justice developed by contemporary philosophers to the
concrete problems faced by urban planners and policymakers and argues that, despite structural obstacles,
meaningful reform can be achieved at the local level.In the first half of The Just City, Fainstein draws on the
work of John Rawls, Martha Nussbaum, Iris Marion Young, Nancy Fraser, and others to develop an
approach to justice relevant to twenty-first-century cities, one that incorporates three central concepts:
diversity, democracy, and equity. In the book's second half, Fainstein tests her ideas through case studies of
New York, London, and Amsterdam by evaluating their postwar programs for housing and development in
relation to the three norms. She concludes by identifying a set of specific criteria for urban planners and
policymakers to consider when developing programs to assure greater justice in both the process of their
formulation and their effects.
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From reader reviews:

Steve Diaz:

Book will be written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Beside
that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book The Just City will make you to always be smarter. You
can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think in which
open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they are often thought like
that? Have you searching for best book or suitable book with you?

Danny Saleem:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information presently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
if those information which is inside the former life are challenging be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you
receive the unstable resource then you buy it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for
you. All of those possibilities will not happen in you if you take The Just City as the daily resource
information.

Thomas Williamson:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Just City can be the reply, oh how comes? It's
a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand-new
era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Michael Clements:

You may get this The Just City by go to the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be
your solve challenge if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by
means of written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era
including now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now,
choose your ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to
make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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