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As colleges and universities become more entrepreneurial in a post-industrial economy, they focus on
knowledge less as a public good than as a commodity to be capitalized on in profit-oriented activities. In
Academic Capitalism and the New Economy, higher education scholars Sheila Slaughter and Gary Rhoades
detail the aggressive engagement of U.S. higher education institutions in the knowledge-based economy and
analyze the efforts of colleges and universities to develop, market, and sell research products, educational
services, and consumer goods in the private marketplace.

Slaughter and Rhoades track changes in policy and practice, revealing new social networks and circuits of
knowledge creation and dissemination, as well as new organizational structures and expanded managerial
capacity to link higher education institutions and markets. They depict an ascendant academic capitalist
knowledge/learning regime expressed in faculty work, departmental activity, and administrative behavior.
Clarifying the regime's internal contradictions, they note the public subsidies embedded in new revenue
streams and the shift in emphasis from serving student customers to leveraging resources from them.

Defining the terms of academic capitalism in the new economy, this groundbreaking study offers essential
insights into the trajectory of American higher education.
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From reader reviews:

Freida Gilbert:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has several
personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't wish do that.
You must know how great along with important the book Academic Capitalism and the New Economy. All
type of book can you see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Christi Potter:

The publication untitled Academic Capitalism and the New Economy is the reserve that recommended to
you to learn. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to anyone. The language that
author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of investigation when
write the book, therefore the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also will
get the e-book of Academic Capitalism and the New Economy from the publisher to make you far more
enjoy free time.

Donald Corbett:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic
from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill your totally
free time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the reserve untitled Academic Capitalism and the New Economy can be good
book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Kimberly Johnson:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is referred to as
of book Academic Capitalism and the New Economy. You can include your knowledge by it. Without
causing the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is
most critical that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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