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Gregorio Cortez Lira, a ranchhand of Mexican parentage, was virtually unknown until one summer day in
1901 when he and a Texas sheriff, pistols in hand, blazed away at each other after a misunderstanding. The
sheriff was killed and Gregorio fled immediately, realizing that in practice there was one law for Anglo-
Texans, another for Texas-Mexicans. The chase, capture, and imprisonment of Cortez are high drama that
cannot easily be forgotten. Even today, in the cantinas along both sides of the Rio Grande, Mexicans sing the
praises of the great "sheriff-killer" in the ballad which they call "El Corrido de Gregorio Cortez." Américo
Paredes tells the story of Cortez, the man and the legend, in vivid, fascinating detail in "With His Pistol in
His Hand," which also presents a unique study of a ballad in the making. Deftly woven into the story are
interpretations of the Border country, its history, its people, and their folkways.
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From reader reviews:

Arthur Bennett:

Here thing why this "With His Pistol in His Hand": A Border Ballad and Its Hero (Texas Classics) are
different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it really depends in the content
from it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. "With His Pistol in His Hand": A Border Ballad
and Its Hero (Texas Classics) giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any guide out
there but there is no reserve that similar with "With His Pistol in His Hand": A Border Ballad and Its Hero
(Texas Classics). It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing in which
happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in
park your car, café, or even in your method home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the
paper book maybe the form of "With His Pistol in His Hand": A Border Ballad and Its Hero (Texas Classics)
in e-book can be your alternate.

Noah Hansell:

The guide with title "With His Pistol in His Hand": A Border Ballad and Its Hero (Texas Classics) posesses a
lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This particular
book exist new know-how the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the
world currently. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book will
bring you throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so
you can read this anywhere you want.

Christine Wormley:

Why? Because this "With His Pistol in His Hand": A Border Ballad and Its Hero (Texas Classics) is an
unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap this but latter it will distress you
with the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who have write the book in
such remarkable way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still
convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you
going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book have such as help
improving your proficiency and your critical thinking way. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I
have been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Della McDonald:

The book untitled "With His Pistol in His Hand": A Border Ballad and Its Hero (Texas Classics) contain a lot
of information on the idea. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published
by famous author. The author gives you in the new period of time of literary works. You can easily read this
book because you can read more your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book in anywhere and



anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site and also order
it. Have a nice learn.
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