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There are few men who are as quintessentially American as Sonny Barger. He is patriotic—a veteran who
loves his country. He is independent—choosing his own path on his motorcycle, living life on his own terms.
He is outspoken—he has boldly criticized injustices in American law and society despite the backlash this
has evoked from the establishment. Yet the element that he finds most important, most sacred, most
American, is freedom.

In Freedom, Sonny articulates many of the principles he employs in his own life. Whether he is regarded as a
leader, a rebel, a revolutionary, a criminal, or a soldier, Sonny's outlook has been influenced not just by
school but by the military, prison, and his experiences riding with the world's most notorious motorcycle
club. It was on these various journeys that he learned the lessons that are most important in his life and the
qualities he respects when he sees them in others:

Independence
Customize Yourself; Originals Don't Come Off an Assembly Line

Toughness
Temper the Steel to Forge a Strong Blade

Fairness
Treat Me Good, I'll Treat You Better; Treat Me Bad, I'll Treat You Worse

Presented in the form of fifty credos, this book gives Sonny Barger's perspective on how to live a life that
embodies the most fundamental of American virtues: freedom.
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From reader reviews:

Bonnie Skelton:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A publication Freedom will make you to
always be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of
you think this open or reading any book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they may be thought
like that? Have you seeking best book or appropriate book with you?

Gary Forsyth:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a publication your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than
other is high. For yourself who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Freedom book as
beginner and daily reading book. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Jared Carter:

Beside this particular Freedom in your phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or
information. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from the oven so don't end up
being worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Freedom because
this book offers to you readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you rarely get what it's
interesting features of. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable
set up here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss it? Find
this book as well as read it from at this point!

Merle Poteet:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book but also novel and Freedom or perhaps others sources were given
know-how for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science
guide was created for teacher or even students especially. Those books are helping them to bring their
knowledge. In some other case, beside science guide, any other book likes Freedom to make your spare time
more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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