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Mary Beth Keane, named one of the 5 Under 35 by the National Book Foundation, has written a
spectacularly bold and intriguing novel about the woman known as “Typhoid Mary,” the first person in
America identified as a healthy carrier of Typhoid Fever.

On the eve of the twentieth century, Mary Mallon emigrated from Ireland at age fifteen to make her way in
New York City. Brave, headstrong, and dreaming of being a cook, she fought to climb up from the lowest
rung of the domestic-service ladder. Canny and enterprising, she worked her way to the kitchen, and
discovered in herself the true talent of a chef. Sought after by New York aristocracy, and with an
independence rare for a woman of the time, she seemed to have achieved the life she’d aimed for when she
arrived in Castle Garden. Then one determined “medical engineer” noticed that she left a trail of disease
wherever she cooked, and identified her as an “asymptomatic carrier” of Typhoid Fever. With this seemingly
preposterous theory, he made Mallon a hunted woman.

The Department of Health sent Mallon to North Brother Island, where she was kept in isolation from 1907 to
1910, then released under the condition that she never work as a cook again. Yet for Mary—proud of her
former status and passionate about cooking—the alternatives were abhorrent. She defied the edict.

Bringing early-twentieth-century New York alive—the neighborhoods, the bars, the park carved out of upper
Manhattan, the boat traffic, the mansions and sweatshops and emerging skyscrapers—Fever is an ambitious
retelling of a forgotten life. In the imagination of Mary Beth Keane, Mary Mallon becomes a fiercely
compelling, dramatic, vexing, sympathetic, uncompromising, and unforgettable heroine.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Alexander:

What do you about book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What
did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They should answer that question because just their can do
which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start from
on pre-school until university need this specific Fever: A Novel to read.

Mavis Strain:

Fever: A Novel can be one of your basic books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away
because this book has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort
to place every word into joy arrangement in writing Fever: A Novel but doesn't forget the main level, giving
the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource information that maybe you can be among it. This
great information can easily drawn you into brand new stage of crucial contemplating.

Curtis Locke:

It is possible to spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This Fever: A Novel is simple to
create you can read it in the park, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not possess much space to
bring typically the printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can
save typically the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy
this book.

Jennifer Mendoza:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Fever: A Novel was colorful and of course has
pictures on there. As we know that book Fever: A Novel has many kinds or category. Start from kids until
teens. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on
there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to
choose the best book in your case and try to like reading which.
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