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Cultivated from sea level to mountaintop, from parched deserts to sodden rain forests, from the rocky Gaspé
Peninsula to the plains of Argentina, corn is the grain of the Americas. In terms of culinary uses, it is
amazingly diverse, reflecting the breathtaking variety of the continents and environments from which it
evolved. The consummate immigrant, corn is grown extensively on every continent except Antarctica.

Market farmer and naturalist Anthony Boutard weaves together this unique plant's contribution to our
culture, its distinctive biology, and the practical information needed to grow and enjoy it at home. Beautiful
Corn advocates a return to the nourishing whole grain that built America, in place of today's genetically
modified crops processed by industrial agriculture into synthetic sweeteners and cheap meat. Come along on
this lyrical and inspiring journey through the seasons, learning about growing and using corn in the
traditional way.

Gardeners and market farmers can lead the way to a healthier country by restoring heritage corn varieties to
our tables. An unabashed celebration of a much-maligned culinary treasure, Beautiful Corn will forever
change the way you view this remarkable plant.

Anthony Boutard is a widely recognized advocate in the local food movement, well-known for his efforts in
reviving long-lost crops and bringing little-known varieties to market. He and his wife Carol own Ayers
Creek Farm, a 144-acre organic market farm in Gaston, Oregon, specializing in berries, beans, grains, and
greens for sale to local restaurants and markets.
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From reader reviews:

Christi Potter:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information
inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of
guide you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really feel
happy read one together with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Beautiful Corn:
America's Original Grain from Seed to Plate is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unstable
experience.

Wayne Millican:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
better to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, paper, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended to your account is Beautiful Corn: America's Original Grain from Seed to Plate this guide
consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is
the world has grown up. The words styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer
made some investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.

Sharon McMichael:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our understanding for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This publication Beautiful Corn: America's Original Grain from Seed to Plate was filled
regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some
people has distinct feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you
can really feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you
wanted.

Myrta Bundy:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but additionally novel and Beautiful Corn: America's Original Grain from
Seed to Plate or others sources were given information for you. After you know how the truly great a book,
you feel want to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or students especially. Those
ebooks are helping them to increase their knowledge. In different case, beside science book, any other book
likes Beautiful Corn: America's Original Grain from Seed to Plate to make your spare time considerably



more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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